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Istat disseminates the main results of the ad hoc module "Health and Safety at work", inserted in the Labour 
Force Survey during the second quarter 2013 and already proposed in the second quarter 2007.  

The main topics of the survey are: accidents at work; work-related health problems; exposure to risk factors 
at work. 

People who claimed they had at least one accident at work or in the course of travelling between home and 
the workplace, were 714,000: corresponding to 2.9% of employed and not employed who were employed in 
the past 12 months. There was a decrease compared to 2007, when they were 937,000, that is 3.7% of total. 

People in the last 12 months who declared work-related health problems or diseases were 2 million 282 
thousand, 5.4% of the total population of employed and not employed with previous work experience.  

The proportion was higher among men (5.7%) than women (5.1%) and among Italians (5.5%) compared to 
foreigners (4.7%). The overall proportion showed a decrease compared to 2007, when it was 6.9%. 

More than half of people reporting health disorders complained about a bone, joint or muscle problem 
(59.0%), especially in the back (29.5%). Health problems of a psychological nature such as stress, 
depression and anxiety affected 11.9% of them. 

Over 17 million of employed people (76.6% of the total) perceived the presence of at least one risk factor for 
health at work; 74.7% felt exposed to at least one physical risk factor. The 8 risk factors investigated were: 
exposure to chemicals, dust, fumes, smoke or gases; exposure to noise or strong vibration; exposure to 
difficult or tiring  work postures; repetitive movements of the hand or arm; other movements that affect 
health; exposure to handling of heavy loads; exposure to activities involving strong visual concentration; 
exposure to risk of accidents.  

On the other hand 27.0% of employed people felt exposed to at least one of the psychological risk factors 
(the 3 factors investigated were: exposure to severe time pressure or work overload; to violence or threat of 
violence; to harassment or bullying). 

Among the physical risk factors, the most common were the repetitive movements of the hand and arm 
(43.6%) and injury (40.2%). Men and the workers were those exposed most. 

The main risk factor for psychological health, both for men and for women, was the "time pressure or 
overload of work" indicated by a quarter of the employed people (25.3%). The highest proportion was 
observed among managers and executives (39.6%), entrepreneurs and professionals (29.6%), clerks 
(29.3%).  

The most affected sectors were the financial and insurance activities (33.4%), information services and 
communication (33.6%), public administration and defense (33.2%) and health (32.6% ). 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



   

FIGURE 1. ACCIDENT RATE OF EMPLOYED PEOPLE  BY ECONOMIC ACTIVITY.  

II quarter  2007 and  II quarter 2013 (percentage values) 
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FIGURE 2. PEOPLE EMPLOYED AND NOT EMPLOYED WITH PREVIOUS WORK EXPERIENCE WHO DECLARED 

WORK-RELATED HEALTH PROBLEMS IN THE LAST 12 MONTHS BY TYPE OF PROBLEM.  

II quarter 2007 and II quarter 2013 (percentage values) 
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For more details please refer to the Italian version 
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